

Product Name	Description	Size	UM	BOB BARKER	VICTORY SUPPLIES	UMI DIRECT	LIBERTY STORE	OD TARAGIN AND BROS LLC	LIGHTHOUSE SOURCING SOLUTIONS	CHARM-TEX	AMERICARE PRODUCTS
MacGregor Indoor\Outdoor Basketball	Basketball,MacGregor def		EA	\$ 20.00	\$ 17.74	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 21.90	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Size Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	32	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.00	NO BID	\$ 23.09	\$ 24.98	\$ 17.18	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	34	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.00	NO BID	\$ 23.09	\$ 24.98	\$ 17.18	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	36	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.00	NO BID	\$ 23.09	\$ 24.98	\$ 17.18	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	38	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.00	NO BID	\$ 23.09	\$ 24.98	\$ 17.18	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	40	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 23.09	\$ 24.98	\$ 18.90	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	42	D12	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.44	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 25.25	\$ 26.33	\$ 19.36	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	44	D12	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.74	\$ 18.00	NO BID	\$ 25.25	\$ 26.33	\$ 19.36	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	46	D12	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.74	\$ 18.00	NO BID	\$ 27.41	\$ 26.33	\$ 19.54	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	48	D12	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.74	\$ 19.00	NO BID	\$ 27.41	\$ 26.33	\$ 19.54	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	50	D12	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.74	\$ 19.00	NO BID	\$ 32.00	\$ 27.68	\$ 19.54	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	52	D12	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.74	\$ 19.00	NO BID	\$ 32.00	\$ 27.68	\$ 19.54	NO BID
Sports Bra	White Cotton\poly\Spandex Blend Hookless No Metal or Plastic	54	D12	\$ 19.00	\$ 17.74	\$ 19.00	NO BID	\$ 32.00	\$ 27.68	\$ 19.54	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	2XL	D12	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.42	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 11.44	\$ 11.14	\$ 11.54	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	3XL	D12	\$ 12.00	\$ 11.42	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 12.52	\$ 11.81	\$ 11.72	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	4XL	D12	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.24	\$ 12.00	NO BID	\$ 13.60	\$ 12.49	\$ 12.36	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	5XL	D12	\$ 13.00	\$ 12.24	\$ 12.00	NO BID	\$ 15.22	\$ 13.16	\$ 12.36	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	6XL	D12	\$ 13.00	\$ 12.24	\$ 12.00	NO BID	\$ 16.84	\$ 13.84	\$ 12.36	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	L	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.49	\$ 9.50	NO BID	\$ 10.36	\$ 10.46	\$ 9.90	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	M	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.49	\$ 9.50	NO BID	\$ 10.36	\$ 10.46	\$ 9.90	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	S	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.49	\$ 9.50	NO BID	\$ 10.36	\$ 10.46	\$ 9.90	NO BID
Briefs	White Cotton\Poly Blend	XL	D12	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.49	\$ 9.50	NO BID	\$ 10.36	\$ 10.46	\$ 9.90	NO BID
Disposable Panty	White Latex free	2XL	C100	\$ 40.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 226.90 PER 400	\$ 53.95
Disposable Panty	White Latex free	3XL	C100	\$ DISC	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 116.90 PER 200	\$ 53.95
Disposable Panty	White Latex free	L	C100	\$ 36.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 194.90 PER 400	\$ 45.00
Disposable Panty	White Latex	M	C100	\$ 36.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 194.90 PER 401	\$ 45.00
Disposable Panty	White Latex	S	C100	\$ 36.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 194.90 PER 402	\$ 45.00
Disposable Panty	White Latex free	XL	C100	\$ 36.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 194.90 PER 403	\$ 45.00
Thermal Drawers	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex	3XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 53.47	\$ 38.00	NO BID	\$ 37.81	\$ 35.10	\$ 54.90	NO BID

Product Name	Description	Size	UM	BOB BARKER	VICTORY SUPPLIES	UMI DIRECT	LIBERTY STORE	OD TARAGIN AND BROS LLC	LIGHTHOUSE SOURCING SOLUTIONS	CHARM-TEX	AMERICARE PRODUCTS
Thermal Drawers	Natural-Cotton Poly BLenD Thermal Unisex	2XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 43.89	\$ 38.00	NO BID	\$ 35.65	\$ 32.40	\$ 45.18	NO BID
Thermal Drawers	Natural-Cotton Poly BLenD Thermal Unisex	L	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 41.52	\$ 38.00	NO BID	\$ 31.60	\$ 28.35	\$ 43.18	NO BID
Thermal Drawers	Natural-Cotton Poly BLenD Thermal Unisex	4XL	D12	\$ 40.00	\$ 55.46	\$ 39.00	NO BID	\$ 39.97	\$ 37.80	\$ 57.18	NO BID
Thermal Drawers	Natural-Cotton Poly BLenD Thermal Unisex	XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 41.52	\$ 39.00	NO BID	\$ 31.60	\$ 28.35	\$ 43.18	NO BID
Transport Hood	Hood,Protective Detainee	N/A	C10	\$ 30.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.90 PER CASE	NO BID
Black Stencil Pants	I/N/M/A/T/E (LEG)	N/A	EA	\$ NO CHARGE	INC.	\$ NO CHARGE	NO BID	\$ 1.15	NO BID	\$ INCLUDED	NO BID
Black Stencil Shirts	INMATE/NEW HANOVER/COUNTY	N/A	EA	\$ NO CHARGE	INC.	\$ NO CHARGE	NO BID	\$ 1.15	NO BID	\$ INCLUDED	NO BID
Isolation\Suicide Cell Blanket	Isolation/Suicide Cell Blanket, GSA Advantage	54 X80	EA	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 133.65	\$ 74.90	NO BID
Isolation\Suicide Cell Smock	Isolation/Suicide Cell Smock Fits all sizes up to 300 lbs	CHEST 44" TO 56"	EA	\$ 71.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.90	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	10	D12	\$ 8.00	\$ 7.11	\$ 8.30	NO BID	\$ 10.37	\$ 10.13	\$ 8.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	11	D12	\$ 8.00	\$ 7.84	\$ 8.35	NO BID	\$ 10.91	\$ 10.80	\$ 8.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	12	D12	\$ 8.00	\$ 7.84	\$ 8.35	NO BID	\$ 10.91	\$ 10.80	\$ 8.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	13	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 7.84	\$ 8.35	NO BID	\$ 10.91	\$ 10.80	\$ 8.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	14	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 7.84	\$ 8.35	NO BID	\$ 11.45	\$ 11.48	\$ 8.90	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	15	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.24	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 11.45	\$ 11.48	\$ 8.90	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	16	D12	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.24	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 11.45	\$ 11.48	\$ 9.80	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	5	D12	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.07	\$ 7.62	NO BID	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.45	\$ 6.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	6	D12	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.07	\$ 7.62	NO BID	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.45	\$ 6.36	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	7	D12	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.07	\$ 7.62	NO BID	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.45	\$ 10.18	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	8	D12	\$ 6.25	\$ 7.11	\$ 7.62	NO BID	\$ 9.83	\$ 9.45	\$ 10.18	NO BID
Panty	White Size Cotton Poly Blend	9	D12	\$ 6.25	\$ 7.11	\$ 7.93	NO BID	\$ 10.37	\$ 10.13	\$ 10.18	NO BID
Max Sec. Pen Black	Pen, Max Sec Black Clear Cover	N/A	C144	\$ 14.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.90	\$ 25.20
Razor	Razor, Single Blade Disposable	N/A	C1000	\$ 45.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 70.18	\$ 51.50
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	10	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	11	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	12	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	13	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	14	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	8	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sandal	Sandal, Tan Pvc Slip On	9	PR	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.72	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.33	\$ 3.38	\$ 1.72	NO BID
Sanitary Napkin	Sanitary Napkn, Ind Wrpd	Regular	C576	\$ 33.00	\$33.24 C500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.90 432/ CASE	\$ 30.50
Shirts	Shirt, Orange, TriStitch	3XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.25 *	NO BID	\$ 9.04	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Orange, TriStitch	4XL	EA	\$ 5.45	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.25 *	NO BID	\$ 9.20	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Orange/White Stripe	L	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.95	\$ 5.25 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	2XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 8.77	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID

Product Name	Description	Size	UM	BOB BARKER	VICTORY SUPPLIES	UMI DIRECT	LIBERTY STORE	OD TARAGIN AND BROS LLC	LIGHTHOUSE SOURCING SOLUTIONS	CHARM-TEX	AMERICARE PRODUCTS
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	L	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 8.77	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 8.77	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	3XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 9.04	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	4XL		\$ 5.45	\$ 5.95	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 9.20	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	5XL	EA	\$ 5.45	\$ 6.75	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 10.06	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	6XL		\$ 8.00	\$ 6.75	\$ 5.40 *	NO BID	\$ 10.06	NO BID	\$ 5.90	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red TriStitch	7XL	EA	\$ 8.00	\$ 6.75	\$ 7.00 *	NO BID	\$ 10.06	NO BID	\$ 6.90	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red/White Striped	L	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.95	\$ 5.50 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red/White Striped	MED	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.95	\$ 5.50 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red/White Striped	2XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.95	\$ 5.50 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red/White Striped	3XL	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 7.75	\$ 5.50 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Red/White Striped	4XL	EA	\$ 4.45	\$ 7.75	\$ 5.50 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Shirts	Shirt, Orange/White Stripe	L	EA	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.95	\$ 5.25*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.36	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	10	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	11	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	12	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	13	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	14	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	6	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	7	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	8	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Tennis Shoes	Shoe, Black Super Bob Velcro Wide With non Metal loop holes	9	PR	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.24 *	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.05	\$ 17.55	\$ 7.90	NO BID
Step In Shoes	Shoe, Men's Black Canvas Step-In	5	PR	\$ 2.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.65	\$ 4.73	\$ 3.90	NO BID
Step In Shoes	Shoe, Men's Black Canvas Step-In	6	PR	\$ 2.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.65	\$ 4.73	\$ 3.90	NO BID
Step In Shoes	Shoe, Men's Black Canvas Step-In	7	PR	\$ 2.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.65	\$ 4.73	\$ 3.90	NO BID
Step In Shoes	Shoe, Men's Black Canvas Step-In	8	PR	\$ 2.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.65	\$ 4.73	\$ 3.90	NO BID
Step In Shoes	Shoe, Men's Black Canvas Step-In	9	PR	\$ 2.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.65	\$ 4.73	\$ 3.90	NO BID
Soap	Soap, BobBarker wrapped #1.25	N/A	C500	\$ 40.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.18	\$ 39.50
Socks	Sock, Crew White	9-12	D12	\$ 4.20	\$ 5.24	\$ 4.15	\$ 3.98	\$ 6.26	\$ 5.40	\$ 4.36	NO BID
Big Foot Socks	Sock, Crew, White	13-16	D12	\$ 4.20	NO BID	\$ 5.79	NO BID	\$ 7.72	\$ 6.08	\$ 5.40	NO BID
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	L	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 38.21	\$ 42.00	NO BID	\$ 31.60	\$ 28.35	\$ 43.18	NO BID
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	2XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 41.44	\$ 43.00	NO BID	\$ 35.65	\$ 32.40	\$ 45.18	NO BID
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	3XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 46.99	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 37.81	\$ 35.10	\$ 54.18	NO BID
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	4XL	D12	\$ 40.00	\$ 49.99	\$ 57.00	NO BID	\$ 39.97	\$ 37.80	\$ 55.18	NO BID

Product Name	Description	Size	UM	BOB BARKER	VICTORY SUPPLIES	UMI DIRECT	LIBERTY STORE	OD TARAGIN AND BROS LLC	LIGHTHOUSE SOURCING SOLUTIONS	CHARM-TEX	AMERICARE PRODUCTS
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	5XL	D12	\$ 40.00	\$ 51.99	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 42.40	\$ 40.50	\$ 56.18	NO BID
Thermal Tops	Natural-Cotton Poly BBlend Thermal Unisex Top	XL	D12	\$ 30.00	\$ 38.21	\$ 43.00	NO BID	\$ 31.60	\$ 28.35	\$ 43.18	NO BID
Trousers	Trousers, Khaki TriStitch	3XL	EA	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.34 INC Screen	\$5.50 *	NO BID	\$ 8.84	NO BID	\$ 6.54	NO BID
Trousers	Trousers, Khaki TriStitch	L	EA	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.34 INC Screen	\$5.50 *	NO BID	\$ 8.09	NO BID	\$ 6.54	NO BID
Trousers	Trousers, Khaki TriStitch	XL	EA	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.34 INC Screen	\$5.50 *	NO BID	\$ 8.09	NO BID	\$ 6.54	NO BID
Trousers	Trousers, Khaki TriStitch	2XL	EA	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.34 INC Screen	\$5.50 *	NO BID	\$ 8.09	NO BID	\$ 6.54	NO BID
								SEE BID SHEET FOR NOTES			